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A B S T R A C T

During the last decade the evaluative content of children’s accounts in interviews has attracted growing interest.
However, research on methods to further enable such accounts remains scarce, specifically with regard to the
youngest children. The present explorative study examined to what extent the computer-assisted interview In My
Shoes (IMS) aided preschool aged children in verbalising experiences of distress or discomfort. Children aged 4
and 5 years old (N = 28) were interviewed about their annual health visit using IMS. The interviews were
analysed qualitatively with a focus on the IMS prompts and children’s evaluative statements. The statements
were also compared to the coded distress displayed at the video recorded health visit.

The results showed that almost all children who in the interviews verbalised experiences of distress/dis-
comfort at the health visit (n = 11) did so in relation to the IMS prompts and questions. These children could
describe and distinguish between their emotional reactions and physical sensations. For some of the children
who did not verbalise emotional content related to the specific visit, IMS still worked as a prompt to elicit
negative emotional experiences associated to other health events (n = 10, whereof 80% were 4 years of age). All
5-year olds who displayed distress at the health visit also verbalised such experiences (n = 6), while almost none
of 4-year-olds did so.

The conclusion is that IMS appears to be a feasible method to aid children verbalising emotional and physical
aspects of negative emotional experiences.

1. Introduction

Within various fields such as social welfare, healthcare, school and
government agencies, children’s perspectives and experiences are in-
creasingly being viewed as important and the UN Convention on the
Rights of the Child (UNCRC) has been ratified in almost all countries in
the world (UN General Assembly, 1989). This place new high demands
on the way children are heard and has led to an increased need for
evidence-based methods for communicating with children. Therefore,
researchers and practitioners are turning to the empirically tested child
interview methods developed within the field of forensic science
(National Board of Health and Welfare, 2015). However, the research
on child forensic interviews has mainly focused on interviewing tech-
niques and methods that affect and enhance children’s cognitive and
factual accounts (Ahern & Lyon, 2013). Less attention has been given to

children’s evaluative accounts and recommendations on how to en-
hance and increase these. There is thus a need to increase knowledge on
supportive and reliable interviewing techniques that can be used in
various fields and that can aid children to express their emotional and
physical reactions to experiences. The interactive computer-assisted
interview In My Shoes is a method that was developed to meet the
requirements of the forensic process (Calam, Cox, Glasgow, Jimmieson,
& Groth Larsen, 2000), and aims to aid children communicating their
emotions. However, whether In My Shoes can help young children to
communicate their emotions related to negative experiences has not
been investigated. The aim of the current study was to qualitatively
explore to what extent the computer-assisted interview In My Shoes
aids preschool aged children in verbalising negative emotional experi-
ences of a health care visit.
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1.1. Evidence-based child interview methods

Over the last 30 years there has been a systematic and imperative
development of evidence-based methods for interviewing children
within the field of forensic science (Ceci & Bruck, 1993; Faller, 2015;
Goodman & Melinder, 2007; Lamb, La Rooy, Malloy, & Katz, 2011). A
corresponding development of structured and systematic child inter-
view methods is lacking in other fields, which might explain why the
interview methods developed within the field of forensic science are
increasingly being transferred to other arenas such as social work,
health care and school (Brubacher, Gilligan, Burrows, & Powell, 2019;
Brubacher & Powell, 2019; Meissner & Lyles, 2019; Silverman, Kurtz, &
Draper, 2016; Cederborg, 2005).

Based on research within the field of memory and forensic science,
there is a good understanding of how memory works and how chil-
dren’s developmental capabilities and vulnerabilities impact the inter-
view (Hershkowitz, Lamb, Orbach, Katz, & Horowitz, 2012; Lamb &
Brown, 2006; Nelson & Fivush, 2004; Peterson, 2012). This knowledge
has formed the basis for a core set of evidence-based components to
facilitating children’s reporting, which are being included in most child
forensic interview protocols. These components consists of; question
type, ground rules, and narrative practice (Faller, 2015; Lamb, Orbach,
Hershkowitz, Esplin, & Horowitz, 2007; Vrij, Hope, & Fisher, 2014).

The main focus of the research in the forensic field, both in analogue
and field studies, has been on the factual content of children’s state-
ments, i.e. accounts of actions, objects and people and the cognitive
factors related to children’s ability to retrieve this information (e.g.
Goodman, Quas, Batterman-Faunce, Riddlesberger, & Kuhn, 1997;
Lamb et al., 2003; Lyon, 2014; Melinder et al., 2010; Schneider &
Bjorklund, 1998). Thus, the recommended best practice components
and evidence-based interview protocols, such as the National Institute
of Child Health and Human Development (NICHD) protocol, have been
developed to increase accuracy and completeness of children’s state-
ments regarding these aspects of experiences (Lamb et al., 2007). Less
attention has been paid to the subjective and evaluative content of
children’s statements and factors that can affect these.

1.2. Evaluative content in child interviews

There are a number of reasons why it is important to aid children in
expressing evaluative content in interviews. Children’s ability to de-
scribe their subjective experiences, including emotions, can impact how
the well-being of the child is perceived and, if interventions are offered,
to target this (Cross & Hershkowitz, 2017; Schalkers, Dedding, &
Bunders, 2015; Wilson, Megel, Enenbach, & Carlson, 2010). This is also
one of the main objectives of child interviews in a social work context,
i.e. to understand more about children’s needs and offer interventions.
In addition, the information children provide on their thoughts, emo-
tions and opinions plays an increasingly important role in decision
making in contexts ranging from case planning, court proceedings to
placement decisions (Boshier & Steel-Baker, 2007; Clark, 2005; Cousins
& Simmonds, 2011; Unrau, 2007). In investigative cases, children’s
accounts of their emotions in relation to abuse are important as they
make the narrative seem more coherent (Lyon, Scurich, Choi,
Handmaker, & Blank, 2012; Snow, Powell, & Murfett, 2009; Westcott &
Kynan, 2006). This in turn can affect the credibility of children’s
statements (Cooper, Quas, & Cleveland, 2014; Landström, Ask,
Sommar, & Willén, 2015; Lyon et al., 2012).

In recent years there has been an increased interest in the evaluative
content of children’s accounts (Fängström, Sarkadi, Lucas, Calam, &
Eriksson, 2017; Karni-Visel, Hershkowitz, Lamb, & Blasbalg, 2019;
Lyon et al., 2012) and how interviewers respond to children’s reports of
such experiences (Iversen, 2019). The evaluative content encompasses
children’s emotional reactions, cognitive content and physical sensa-
tions in relation to their experiences of, for example, violence, abuse or
maltreatment (Stolzenberg, Williams, McWilliams, Liang, & Lyon,

2019). It can also include how children experience the interview si-
tuation per se. Previous studies have shown that children seldom
mention their emotional or physical reactions spontaneously in forensic
interviews. For example, Westcott and Kynan (2004) examined in-
vestigative interviews with children aged 4–12 and concluded that only
5% of children under 7 years of age spontaneously described their
emotional reactions (20% of all children). No child under 7 described
their physical reactions unprompted (10% of all children).

In parallel with the fact that the emotional aspects of children's
statements have received more attention generally, research in the
forensic field has increased on these factors (Ahern & Lyon, 2013; Katz,
Paddon, & Barnetz, 2016). For example, the NICHD protocol has been
revised to also take into account socio-emotional factors that may affect
the interview (Hershkowitz, 2009). The revised protocol (RP) was de-
signed to emphasise supportive interviewing in order to increase chil-
dren’s cooperativeness (Hershkowitz, Lamb, & Katz, 2014). More recent
studies have focused on specific interviewing protocols or techniques to
increase the evaluative information in children’s statements. For ex-
ample, Karni-Visel et al. (2019) investigated whether The Revised
NICHD Protocol (RP) could increase children’s (age 4–14 years old)
communication of emotions. The RP includes techniques for enhanced
rapport building, support, and instructions on how to prompt for
emotions when they are not spontaneously mentioned. The authors
concluded that the RP not only increased children’s expression of di-
verse emotions related to the abuse, but also that the emotional ex-
pressiveness was associated with increased informativeness overall. A
recent study by Stolzenberg et al. (2019) examined the relation be-
tween question type and the subjective content of children’s accounts.
They showed that “how feel” and “what think” questions were parti-
cularly helpful to elicit subjective responses and when these questions
were followed up by requests to elaborate on the answer, the pro-
ductivity increased. Despite the increase in understanding how ques-
tions and supportive interviewing can aid children in general, knowl-
edge on how to specifically support the youngest children to express the
emotions related to their experiences is still lacking.

1.3. Interviewing aids

Previous studies have demonstrated that younger children are less
likely compared to older children to generate memory cues on their
own, which impacts their ability to provide information in interviews
(Lyon, McWilliams, & Williams, 2019). Young children therefore need
more scaffolded and focused age appropriate questions (Lamb et al.,
2003). In addition to these, they might also benefit from being provided
with external retrieval cues, such as visual or verbal cues (Hamond &
Fivush, 1991; Saywitz & Camparo, 2013). The cues can assist the re-
instatement of the environment in which the input was encoded, and
facilitate the recall of an episodic event (Tulving & Thomson, 1973).
However, the use of props and cues in child forensic interviews has
been criticised as a wealth of research points to the risk of using aids
such as dolls, body diagrams and other props (e.g. Brown, Pipe, Lewis,
Lamb, & Orbach, 2007; Ceci & Bruck, 1993; Goodman & Melinder,
2007). These props have been demonstrated to decrease the accuracy of
children’s verbal reports, especially for young children (Bruck, Ceci,
Francouer, & Renick, 1995; Hungerford, 2005). The communicative
shortcomings of young children have encouraged researchers to con-
tinue to explore methods that aid children’s memory without compro-
mising accuracy. One method that has been developed for this purpose
is the Narrative Elaboration interview technique (NE) (Saywitz &
Snyder, 1996). This technique includes external visual cues in the form
of pictorial cue cards to aid children to provide the sort of information
needed. Four cards are used: participants, setting, actions and thoughts/
conversations/affective states. Prior to or at the beginning of the in-
terview, children are trained to use these cards to aid their memory
retrieval (Saywitz & Camparo, 2013). Empirical studies have concluded
that the NE technique can benefit both elementary school-aged children
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(Brown & Pipe, 2003a; Brown & Pipe, 2003b; Camparo, Wagner, &
Saywitz, 2001) and preschool-aged children (Bowen & Howie, 2002;
Dorado & Saywitz, 2001) to provide accurate and complete informa-
tion. One study has examined whether NE also aid children to increase
the emotionally evaluated recall (Peterson, Warren, & Hayes, 2013). In
the study, 52 children aged 3–7 years old, were interviewed about a
highly stressful real-life event, whereof half were interviewed with the
NE technique and half with a standardised verbal interview. The results
demonstrated that the children interviewed with NE provided sig-
nificantly more information about their emotions and thoughts com-
pared to the children interviewed with the standardised method. The
authors discuss that by presenting emotional cues the child is instructed
on what information the interviewer wants and the cue remind children
to include that information (Brubacher, Peterson, La Rooy, Dickinson, &
Poole, 2019). The results are in line with previous research showing
that using icons expressing different emotions and labelling emotional
reactions can enhance the recall of information that relates to the
emotion state (Liwag & Stein, 1995). Studies have also demonstrated
that if children are provided with techniques that require less complex
verbal or nonverbal responses, their communication of emotions can be
enhanced (Measelle, Ablow, Cowan, & Cowan, 1998; Welsh & Bierman,
2003).

A fairly novel approach in child interviews is the use of computers
as aids. Today there is a range of techniques including for example
computer-assisted self-interviews (Davies & Morgan, 2005; Morgan &
Fraser, 2010), computer-assisted personal interviews (Jones, Price, &
Selby, 1998), and avatar interviewing aids (Hsu & Teoh, 2017). One
advantage of computers is that children find it an enjoyable tool, which
can increase their engagement, motivation and attention (Wrzesien &
Alcañiz Raya, 2010; Steward et al., 1996). When the computer is used
as a party in the conversation between the interviewer and the inter-
viewee it becomes a triadic conversation (Scott & Purves, 1996; Grasso,
Atkinson, & Jimmieson, 2013). The triadic conversation as well as the
use of an interactive computer software as an aid, is thought to increase
a collaborative atmosphere (Coyle, Doherty, & Sharry, 2009), reduce
the child’s stress (Steward et al., 1996), and allow children to express
themselves in various ways (Butler, Gross, & Hayne, 1995; Measelle
et al., 1998).

1.4. The computer-assisted interview In My Shoes

The computer-assisted interview In My Shoes is an interviewing tool
developed to aid children verbalising their experiences, thoughts and
emotions. It was developed to work across services, and it can be used
to talk to children about their experiences in various settings and in
relation to different people in these settings. In My Shoes consists of a
series of modules with stylised icons of places, people, emotions,
speech, thoughts and sensations. The icons are a visual support to
children’s communication as it can aid the memory retrieval and pro-
vide children with more ways to express themselves, i.e. they can point
to the screen, click with the mouse or write. A trained interviewer sits
side-by-side with the child, using In My Shoes together, which means it
becomes a triadic interview. The modules give a structure and a scaffold
to the interview and the icons also function as a prompt for the inter-
viewer to pose questions in various areas (Grasso et al., 2013).

In My Shoes was developed to aid children to self-express and to
provide reliable information and several considerations have been
made to achieve this. First, the icons used in the program are based on
children’s drawings and evaluated stepwise with children to make sure
that they capture children’s sentiments and support their communica-
tion (Grasso et al., 2013). Another important consideration is that the
recommended questions posed by the interviewer when using In My
Shoes adhere to best practice interviewing to elicit children’s experi-
ences in their own words. In addition, the modules move from less
emotive to potentially more emotive areas (Calam, Cox, et al., 2000),
and the first modules are used to build rapport, while the subsequent

three modules constitute the substantive phase. Another feature of In
My Shoes is that all the choices made, the scenes that are created and
everything typed into the program is automatically saved into a tamper-
proof log, which can be printed and used in investigative or therapeutic
contexts (Calam, Cox, et al., 2000). Moreover, the interviewer clearly
conveys that the program is not a game or a toy, something which is
further emphasised by the simple graphics (Calam, Cox, Glasgow,
Jimmieson, & Groth Larsen, 2014).

In My Shoes differs from regular verbal interview protocols as well
as from computer-assisted self-interviews in several ways. One of the
significant features of In My Shoes is that it includes visual support in
the form of icons to aid children’s communication. These icons are used
interactively by the child and help personalise the interview, e.g. the
child chooses a representation for him/herself, the emotion icons fly
onto or can be manually placed on people when used etc. (Calam, Cox,
et al., 2000). One of the main ideas in In My Shoes is that emotions can
be an important starting point for aiding children’s memory retrieval.
By systematically asking children about both positive and negative
emotions as well as providing them with the emotional prompt in the
form of emotional icons, children are encouraged and guided to ver-
balise or graphically demonstrate their experiences (Grasso et al.,
2013). In addition, the fact that the interview is conducted as a triadic
conversation between the child, the computer and the interviewer, also
constitutes an important characteristic.

In My Shoes has been used and evaluated in a range of contexts
(Barrow & Hannah, 2012; Calam, Cox, Glasgow, Jimmieson, & Larsen,
2000; Cousins & Simmonds, 2011; Fängström et al., 2016; Fängström,
Salari, Eriksson, & Sarkadi, 2017; Bøhren & Stabrun, 2013). However,
its ability to help children verbalise emotions related to negative ex-
periences has not been previously explored.

1.5. The current study

The purpose of the present study was to qualitatively explore to
what extent the computer-assisted interview In My Shoes aids preschool
aged children in verbalising experiences of distress or discomfort. The
data relating to In My Shoes was gathered in the context of health care.
The child’s annual health visit at the Child Health Centre (CHC) was
video recorded and 14–37 days later the child was interviewed about
the visit. We were thus able to compare children’s accounts of their
emotional experiences relating to the health visit with the observable
signs of discomfort or distress in the same visit. We chose to study the
health visits for children aged 4 and 5 years, as these visits include
procedures that contain interaction and physical contact, which could
evoke different emotional reactions.

We specifically focused on the following questions:

• To what extent do children verbalise experiences of distress/dis-
comfort in the In My Shoes interviews?

• How does In My Shoes work as a prompt for emotional experiences?
• What type of evaluative information is included in the children’s
statements?

• What is the relationship between the distress/discomfort at the
health visit and verbalised distress/discomfort in the interviews?

2. Methods

2.1. Participants

The participants in the present study were extracted from a study in
which 54 children aged 4 and 5 years old were interviewed about their
annual health visit at the Child Health Centre (CHC). Children were
randomised to be interviewed with either In My Shoes or a standard
investigative interview protocol, and the aim was to compare the in-
terview methods on various aspects (Fängström et al., 2016). Both the
health visit and the interview were video recorded.
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The current study included 28 children interviewed with In My
Shoes for whom there were video-recorded data from both the health
visit and the interview. The sample consisted of children aged 4 years
(n = 16, M = 48.1, range 46–50 months) and children aged 5 years
(n = 12, M = 60.6, range 59–65 months). Of the 4-year-olds 43.8%
were girls and of the 5-year-olds 58.3% were girls. The CHCs which
recruited participants were situated in areas with varying socio-demo-
graphic characteristics, with respect to ethnic diversity (country of
origin in publicly available data in Sweden) and level of education, and
they had been selected to increase the likelihood of a heterogeneous
sample. Despite this, only 14.3% of the children had at least one parent
born outside Sweden (compared to 14.8% for the whole sample in the
study, and 34% at a national level) and 21.4% of the parents had a level
of education below college/university level (compared to 16.7% for the
whole sample and 37% in the target population).

The study was approved by the Regional Ethical Review Board in
Uppsala, Sweden, #2012/387.

2.2. Procedure

The recruitment of families was carried out at five CHCs in two
larger municipalities in Sweden. Written information about the study
was sent home to families together with the notice for the routine
health visit for children aged 4 or 5 years old. The information was
available in Swedish and in the five most common foreign languages in
Sweden (English, Arabic, Kurmanji, Somali, and Sorani). Specific child
friendly information about the study was produced for parents to read
to their children. Nurses were instructed to invite all families with
children aged 4 and 5 years as there were no exclusion criteria except
child age. For parents who had given their written consent and the child
her/his verbal assent, the nurse video-recorded the health visit.
Fourteen to 37 days (M = 20.6, SD = 6.5 days) after the health visit,
the child was interviewed about the visit and the interview was video
recorded. Two interviewers conducted all interviews, whereof one is
the main author. Each interviewer had a master’s degree in psychology
or sociology, both had comprehensive experience of conducting child
interviews and were Registered In My Shoes Interviewers. The inter-
viewers had general knowledge about what procedures were included
in the health visits but had no information about the visit for each
specific child prior to the interview.

2.3. The health visit at the Child Health Centres in Sweden

The CHCs in Sweden reach 99 percent of all families with children
up to age six. Families with children aged 2–5 years, meet the Child
Health nurse every year for a health check-up. The visit includes an
assessment of the child’s general health as well as an evaluation of the
child’s physical and psychosocial development. In addition, children at
age 4 undergo a standardised test for vision which entails identifying
certain letters of different sizes at 3 m of distance. Children at age 5
receive a vaccine injection in addition to the general assessment. We
chose to include 4- and 5-year old children in the current study as the
procedures during their check-ups could be perceived as un-
comfortable, distressful, painful, or frightening, which could resemble
children’s experiences in investigative cases.

2.4. Interviews using In My Shoes

All the interviews included in the present study were conducted
using the In My Shoes computer-assisted interview. The interview
started with the interviewer presenting him or herself, asking for the
child’s assent and both showed and informed the child how to end the
interview whenever the child wished to do so. The four interview
ground rules for this specific interview were then explained, e.g. 1) “If I
ask a question and you don’t understand, you can say ‘I don’t under-
stand’”; 2) “If I say things that are wrong, you should tell me. Okay?”; 3)

“If I ask a question and you don’t know the answer, don’t guess - just say
‘I don’t know’”; 4) “It is important that you only tell the truth, about
things that really happened to you. Okay?”. Thereafter, the interviewer
started the In My Shoes interview. In the first module, the child chose a
representation for her/himself. The second module encompasses a
palette with icons expressing different emotions and the task was for
the child to name the emotions he/she recognised. The following
module, module three, allowed the child to practice applying the
emotion icons to a child in different set scenes and to expand shortly
about the choice. These modules constituted the rapport phase of the
interview. The interview was then directed to the visit at the CHC, by
the interviewer showing the child two pictures, one of the entrances to
the CHC, and one of the CHC waiting room. If the child did not re-
cognise the pictures, a follow up question was posed, “This is the place
children go to their 4- or 5-year health check-up. Do you recognise this
place?”. If this was not sufficient to aid the child, the interview was
ended. If the child recognised the CHC from the pictures the interview
continued and module six was used in which the child chose a re-
presentation for each person present at the CHC visit which she/he
could remember. In the last module, module seven, the child was en-
couraged to narrate in relation to each of the emotions on the emotion
palette. The emotion icons were presented in a fixed order for each
child, i.e. happy, sad, nervous, a little happy, a little sad, angry, scared.
For each emotion, the interviewer posed the question “When you were
at the CHC (or the child’s name of the place), did you ever feel like
this?” or “Here you are at the CHC, and you are happy [pointing to the
screen with the child figure with a certain emotion]. Did you ever feel
like this?” If the child said “No” the interview proceeded to the next
emotion. If the child replied “Yes”, the interviewer followed up with
“Tell me about that” or a similar invitation or cued invitation. The child
could then narrate using the icons of people, thought and speech bub-
bles, and emotions as visual support. The focus of the interviews was to
enable children to provide factual information about the visit and the
interviewers made an effort to use the recommended types of questions
(i.e. open-ended questions and wh-questions when needed). When the
child could no longer reveal more about the visit, or when he/she asked
to stop, the interview was finished. The interviewer thanked the child
for participating and offered a small gift (a sticker or a stick-on tattoo).

2.5. Data analysis

In the first step the In My Shoes interviews were analysed qualita-
tively focusing on evaluative statements relating to the procedures at
the health visit and the In My Shoes prompts or/and interviewer
questions preceding these statements. In the second step the video-re-
corded child health visits were coded for observable signs of discomfort
or distress. In the third step the observations were then compared with
the evaluative statements for each child. The steps of analysis are fur-
ther described below.

2.5.1. The first step - analysing the interviews
The interviews were transcribed verbatim and all names were re-

moved. When the interviewer or child stated something and referred to
it by pointing at the screen, this was added in brackets to the transcript.
The two authors systematically read through all interviews focusing on
the children’s evaluative statements. Evaluative statements were de-
fined as any statement including emotional (i.e. scared) or physical (i.e.
hurt) content relating to the examination procedures. Based on the
outcome, interviews were categorised into two main groups, those
containing statements of distress or discomfort and those not containing
any such statements. In the group of interviews containing statements
of distress/discomfort, some children provided information on distress/
discomfort that was not related to the specific health visit nor to the
child’s own emotions. These interviews were extracted and formed a
separate group.

After identifying the two groups if interviews, the next step was to
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systematically review all the interview sequences in which children
made statements about distress/discomfort. The qualitative analysis
drew on conversation analysis in that sense that questions and answers
exemplify social action: The initiating first part, for example a question,
sets up restrictions for a responding second part, the answer (Iversen,
2012). However, a detailed analysis of the interaction was not per-
formed. Particular attention was paid to the In My Shoes prompts and
interviewer questions that preceded the children’s evaluative state-
ments. The interviewer questions that preceded the evaluative state-
ments were analysed and coded into 7 categories. Five of these cate-
gories were comparable to those used in previous studies (Lamb et al.,
2003; Stolzenberg et al., 2019). The categories were 1) Invitations, such
as “Tell me all about when you were at the CHC”, including cued in-
vitations, e.g. “Tell me more about the shot”; 2) directive, i.e. wh-
questions, to invite the child to provide information on the “who”,
“what”, “where” and “when”; 3) Yes/no questions such as “Do you
remember what colour she had on her hair?”; 4) leading questions for
example “ It hurt, didńt it?”; 5) Wh-questions that explicitly focused on
evaluative content, such as “How did it feel?”, were coded as evaluative
questions. Another two categories are specific to the In My Shoes in-
terview protocol and are posed together with the icons of emotions.
These were coded as follow; 6) In My Shoes yes/no question, e.g. “Did
you ever feel like this, that you were [emotion]?”; 7) In My Shoes cued
invitation referring to the emotion or information previously mentioned
by the child, e.g. “Tell about that”. In the present study these categories
are discussed in the context of In My Shoes as a prompt for experiences
of distress or discomfort. In line with recommended procedure for re-
porting the interactional aspect of qualitative interviews (Potter &
Hepburn, 2005), the interview extracts presented in the results section
are illustrative examples of the patterns of interview sequences identi-
fied in the data, including variations of the patterns.

2.5.2. The second step - coding observed distress/discomfort at the health
visit

The video recorded health visits were analysed using the
Observational Scale of Behavioural Distress (OSBD) (Jay, Ozolins,
Elliott, & Caldwell, 1983). The OSBD is an ordinarily used instrument to
assess observable signs of distress during medical procedures. The
child’s behaviour was coded from 1 min before the specific age-related
procedure to 1-minute post the procedure (e.g. vision test for 4-year-
olds and vaccine injection for 5-year-olds). The vision test was not ex-
pected to be painful and the behaviours coded thus reflected dis-
comfort. Each behaviour was scored as having occurred or not, the
intensity of the behaviour was noted and by summarising this a total
score ranging from 1 to 5 was obtained for each child. Based on this
coding two groups emerged: those who showed no to minimal signs of
distress (score 1–2, named No distress/discomfort in the further ana-
lysis) and children with moderate to high distress (3–5, named Distress/
discomfort). Two raters conducted the coding and the inter-rater re-
liability was assessed using Cohen’s kappa (Cohen, 1960). Based on the
coding of 15 interviews by both raters, the obtained kappa was 0.82,
which indicates high agreement (Landis & Koch, 1977).

The mean values and standard deviations were calculated for the
total score on OSBD and separately for the two age groups. A Mann-
Whitney U test was performed to analyse the difference in total dis-
tress/discomfort between the age groups.

2.5.3. The third step - comparing the analysed interviews with the observed
distress/discomfort

The two authors compared the coded interviews with the coded
observable signs of distress/discomfort at the health visit for each child.
Four categories emerged: 1) observed and verbalised distress/dis-
comfort; 2) observed but no verbalised; 3) no observed but verbalised;
and 4) no observed and no verbalised.

One of the authors both coded the interviews and coded the visits.
The other of the two authors was blind to results of the coded visits

before analysing the interviews. Efforts were made to reduce bias, i.e.
any name had been concealed in the transcribed interviews and more
than 10 months passed between analysing the interviews and coding
the visits.

3. Results

3.1. The extent of children’s verbalisation of experiences of distress/
discomfort

During the interviews, in total eleven children (39%) expressed
having experienced the specific procedure (i.e. vaccination for the 5-
year-olds or vision test, optometric examination, for the 4-year-olds) at
the health visit as highly or moderately distressing or causing dis-
comfort. All of these children, except one, were 5 years of age (n = 10).
The verbalisation of distress or discomfort was linked to the In My
Shoes specific structure of the interview as well as different types of
interview questions, presented below.

3.2. In My Shoes as a prompt for emotional experiences

What is specific for In My Shoes as an interview method is the way
different emotions, illustrated by computer images/icons, are used as
points of entry into the exploration of children’s experiences (in this
case, of the visit to the CHC). The child is presented with a suggestion
that she or he might have felt in a specific way (yes/no). In the current
set of data, these In My Shoes emotion prompts are mainly combined
with open-ended or evaluative follow-up questions, which aid chil-
dren’s verbalisation of negative emotions such as sadness or fear, or
negative sensations such as pain.

Almost all children who in the interviews verbalised experiences of
distress/discomfort at the health visit (n = 11) did so in relation to the
IMS prompts and questions. The analysis of all the interview sequences
that preceded children’s evaluative statements revealed different ex-
amples where the interviewer follows the In My Shoes interview
structure, by asking the child about ever feeling in a specific way while
visiting the CHC, and then by adding an open-ended question as a
follow-up question. In some cases, the child elaborates on the emotion
and/or sensation. In other examples verbalisation of negative emotions
or sensations come after a few follow-up questions, as can be seen in
extract 1:

3.2.1. Extract 1, child 5 years old

259. INTERVIEWER: Here you are at the [CHC] and here you are happy
[points at the child’s figure with a happy face at the screen]. And
was it any time you were happy when you were at the CHC?

260. RESPONDENT: Yes
261. INTERVIEWER: Tell about that.
262. RESPONDENT: When I was… after I had had the shot.
263. INTERVIEWER: Mm, then you were happy?
264. RESPONDENT: Yes, since I got a [hard to hear, some kind of

Elastoplast]
265. INTERVIEWER: A what kind of Elastoplast?
266. RESPONDENT: A silvery Elastoplast.
267. INTERVIEWER: Silvery Elastoplast. Tell about the shot.
268. RESPONDENT: I thought it hurt a bit.

After the child answers “yes” to the question about feeling happy at
the CHC, the interviewer asks for an elaboration by adding the open-
ended question “tell me about that” (261). The child then talks about
being happy after getting a shot, and in the following dialogue adds that
this was due to a silvery Elastoplast that the child had been given. It is
only after a second prompt, specifying that the interviewer wants the
child to “tell about the shot” (row 267), that the child says that “it hurt
a bit”.
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The data set contains a number of examples showing that the In My
Shoes specific way of exploring children’s experiences (i.e. using dif-
ferent emotions as points of entry in talking about children’s visit to the
health clinic) clearly opens up for children verbalising negative emo-
tions or sensations when followed by open-ended or evaluative follow-
up questions. However, it can be noted that some cases in this sample
also show that with this mode of interviewing, some children only
verbalise negative emotions or sensations after multiple open-ended
and/or evaluative follow-up questions, as extract 2 exemplifies. This
interview interaction comes from the end of the substantive phase of
the interview, at the end of the different In My Shoes emotional
prompts.

3.2.2. Extract 2, child 5 years old

186. INTERVIEWER: No. And then the last question. Did you ever feel
that you were scared?

187. RESPONDENT: Yes.
188. INTERVIEWER: Tell about when you felt scared.
189. RESPONDENT: Eh… it was when I got the shot.
190. INTERVIEWER: You got a shot.
191. RESPONDENT: [nods]
192. INTERVIEWER: Tell all you remember about when you got the

shot.
193. RESPONDENT: Eh… I don’t remember anything more.
194. INTERVIEWER: No. But who was it that gave you the shot then?
195. RESPONDENT: It was she who… eh… she who… I don’t re-

member.
196. INTERVIEWER: Okay, she who you don’t remember.
197. RESPONDENT: Mm.
198. INTERVIEWER: Was it she that you… she? [points at a female

figure at the screen selected by the child in previous module]
199. RESPONDENT: Mm.
200. INTERVIEWER: Mm. What clothes did she have?
201. RESPONDENT: White clothes.
202. INTERVIEWER: Okay. Do you remember what colour she had on

her hair?
203. RESPONDENT: Eh… No.
204. INTERVIEWER: No. It’s good that you tell when you can’t re-

member. What did dad do when you got a shot?
205. RESPONDENT: He… eh… I don’t remember.
206. INTERVIEWER: No. How did it feel to get the shot then?
207. RESPONDENT: Eh… pain.
208. INTERVIEWER: Pain. Okay. What happened after you had had the

shot?
209. RESPONDENT: She asked if I wanted an Elastoplast and I did want

that.

After the first question in this turn of talk, the child agrees to feeling
scared at some point at the CHC visit (row 187) and links this emotion
to getting a shot (row 189). After that, the interviewer prompts the
child with open-ended questions or specifying wh-questions nine times
– and gets three “I don’t remember” as a response (row 193, 195, 205) –
before adding the evaluative “How did it feel to get the shot then?”
(row 206), and then the child states that the shot was painful. This
example illustrates the level of effort sometimes required from both
interviewer and child to enable the child’s verbalisation of difficult
experiences. It also points to the importance of working through all of
the different emotional prompts in the In My Shoes structure, as it may
be only the last one that “fits” with the child’s experiences.

In addition, it might be the case that none of the In My Shoes
prompts resonates with the child. In one such case found in the dataset;
the child has answered “No” to all suggested negative emotions.
Instead, the child’s verbalisation of negative sensations comes after
evaluative questions, as can be seen in extract 3:

3.2.3. Extract 3, child 5 years old

274. INTERVIEWER: Aa. But tell, what did you do more at nurse
[name]? Or what was it that happened?

275. RESPONDENT: Got a, I got a… eh, eh, five-years shot.
276. INTERVIEWER: You got a shot as well.
277. RESPONDENT: Mm, a five-years shot.
278. INTERVIEWER: Aha, tell, how was that?
279. RESPONDENT: It hurt quite a lot.
280. INTERVIEWER: Yees.
281. RESPONDENT: Oh, oh… she did… so I shouldn’t… well did the

shot, there, at that shoulder that I… on the arm that I shouldn’t
dr… that I should draw with.

282. INTERVIEWER: Aha, so she did on the other arm compared to the
hand that you draw with.

283. RESPONDENT: Yes.

After the child has stated that one of the things which happened at
the CHC was getting a “five-years shot”, the interviewer moves slightly
away from the interview protocol by immediately adding the evaluative
“how was that” after starting off the question with a “tell” (278), and
the child then states that it “hurt quite a lot”. It can be noted that the
child also narrates how the nurse decided to give the shot in the arm not
used to draw with. As the interviewer moves away from the re-
commendation to first use open ended follow-up questions, it is hard to
assess to what extent the evaluative question was needed for the child
to verbalise negative sensations.

3.3. Types of evaluative information included in the children’s statements

In My Shoes uses emotions as prompts to talk about experiences at
the CHC, and the children in the data set tend to respond to these
prompts by including information about both emotions and physical
sensations (such as pain) in their narratives. An example of how the In
My Shoes emotion prompts also seem to aid memories and verbalisation
of physical sensations can be found in extract 4:

3.3.1. Extract 4, child 5 years old

241. INTERVIEWER: Mm. Eh… now let’s see. Did you ever feel this way
[points to the screen]? That you were sad when you were there at
the child place?

242. RESPONDENT: Yes, because I got a shot… I was a bit sad then.
243. INTERVIEWER: Okay, you were a bit sad… you got a shot.
244. RESPONDENT: Mm.
245. INTERVIEWER: Tell everything you remember about the shot.
246. RESPONDENT: Eh… I got to collect the things.
247. INTERVIEWER: You got to collect the things?
248. RESPONDENT: Mm.
249. INTERVIEWER: Yes.
250. RESPONDENT: And… eh… it fel… and then it was sharp.
251. INTERVIEWER: The shot?
252. RESPONDENT: Yes.

[−−−]
289. INTERVIEWER: But you [name], did you ever feel…
290. RESPONDENT: No…
291. INTERVIEWER: … that way??
292. RESPONDENT: Eh… Yes. I got a bit scared that it might hurt.
293. INTERVIEWER: Okay, you got a bit scared that it might hurt?
294. RESPONDENT: Mm.
295. INTERVIEWER: Mm. Is it the shot you mean?
296. RESPONDENT: Yes.
297. INTERVIEWER: Mm. I understand. So, before you were a little…

little scared?
298. RESPONDENT: Yes.
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This extract starts off by the interviewer following the In My Shoes
interview structure, asking the child about ever feeling in a specific way
(sad) while visiting the CHC. This question prompts the child men-
tioning both feeling sad at the health visit and the injection. During the
interview interaction that follows, the child adds that the injection was
“sharp” (Sw. vass), which can be interpreted as referring to an embo-
died experience rather than an emotion. Later in the interview (37 rows
omitted), the child adds another emotion, and elaborates even further
about the relationship between the emotions and experiences of getting
a shot.

An even more explicit example of a distinction between emotions
and physical sensations can be found in extract 5:

3.3.2. Extract 5, child 5 years old

219. INTERVIEWER: That one [module in the In My Shoes programme]
takes a bit longer, right, here you are at the doctor’s, at the hos-
pital, was it some time you felt in that way [points at the screen],
happy?

220. RESPONDENT: Mm.
221. INTERVIEWER: Tell about that, what happened when you were

[there] and felt happy?
222. RESPONDENT: When I got the shot, but it didn’t hurt.
223. INTERVIEWER: It didn’t hurt?
224. RESPONDENT: [Shakes head].
225. INTERVIEWER: And then you got happy?
226. RESPONDENT: Mm.
227. INTERVIEWER: Tell more about the shot.
228. RESPONDENT: I god sad.
229. INTERVIEWER: You got sad?
230. RESPONDENT: Mm.
231. INTERVIEWER: But it didn’t hurt?
232. RESPONDENT: [shakes head].
233. INTERVIEWER: No [agreeing].
234. RESPONDENT: At first, I didn’t want to but then I dared to.

In this example, the child gives a short response to the question in
line with the In My Shoes structure, ”Mm”, and the interviewer then
adds another prompt, the open-ended question ”Tell about that”. In the
interview interaction that follows, the child makes a distinction be-
tween embodied experiences (”hurt”) and feeling happy, feeling sad,
and possibly also feeling scared although this is only hinted at, in row
234, when the child states that s/he “dared to” have the shot. It can be
noted that this example is a bit of an exception in the data set as the
child spontaneously elaborates this distinction after an open-ended
follow-up question.

In summary, the analysis of the interviews revealed that when
children verbalised negative experiences they distinguished between
embodied and emotional aspects of these experiences. As the examples
above show, some children (n = 4) could describe both physical sen-
sations such as pain as well as emotions such as being sad or scared.
Other children (n = 3) only described emotions, while yet others
(n = 4) described only physical sensations.

3.4. In My Shoes as prompt for other emotional experiences

In the group of children who did not verbalise any negative emo-
tional or sensory experiences relating to the visit at the CHC (n = 17),
ten children provided statements including distress or discomfort that
were related to other health events, context or experiences. The ma-
jority of these children were 4 years old (n = 8). These experiences
included other health visits, the emotions of a sibling during a health
visit or some other experiences somehow linked to visiting the health
clinic. An example of the latter can be found in extract 6.

3.4.1. Extract 6, child 4 years old

309. INTERVIEWER: Well I think we are done then. But that one.
Scared, did you feel scared when you were there at any point?

310. RESPONDENT: Yes, when I walked there… when I walked by
myself with the cars I got scared and I ran to dad since I did not
want that a car would run me over.

311. INTERVIEWER: No that was good. But when you were at the four-
year check-up, were you scared then?

312. RESPONDENT: No
313. INTERVIEWER: No, okay. No, but then we are done, if there isn’t

anything else you remember from the four-year check-up?
314. RESPONDENT: No there wasn’t anything more.

When asked about feeling scared “when you were there at any
point?”, the child refers to an event taking place on the way to the
health clinic, “when I walked there” (row 310), when the child felt
scared and explain that the fear was about being scared about being run
over by a car. One interpretation of this narrative provided by the child
is that the question about feeling in a certain way “at any point” can be
heard by the child as including events leading up to, as well as follow
upon, the visit itself. Still, the experiences that the child talks about are
linked to the health visits which are the focus for the interview.

Another example of how children narrate negative experiences can
be found in extract 8, where the child describes the reactions of a sib-
ling:

3.4.2. Extract 7, child 4 years old

217. INTERVIEWER: Yes, good. So now we will do this one. This one is
the last one, but it takes a bit longer time. Here are you and there
you are there at the hospital at the four-years check-up, then you
feel like not so good [points at the child’s figure with a little sad
emotion at the screen]. Did you feel like that any time when you
were there?

218. RESPONDENT: No, I was feeling good.
219. INTERVIEWER: You were feeling good.
220. RESPONDENT: Yes, since they did not give me a shot, only Smally

[younger sibling]. And Smally did not feel so good.
221. INTERVIEWER: He did not feel so good?
222. RESPONDENT: No since he got a shot.

From the dialogue that follows from the question about feeling a
specific way at the visit at the CHC, it can be concluded that the child
associates the emotion in question to, and is talking about, when a
younger sibling – “Smally”- got a shot, and “did not feel so good” (row
220). This could have happened at the same time as the 4-year old visit,
or at another visit to a health clinic. In particular, some of the four-year
olds in the sample seem to be prompted to talk about other events than
the one intended and asked about by the interviewer. However, as ar-
gued above, they still stay roughly within the same realm of experiences
(of health care) and keep to the context provided by the interview (a
health visit).

3.5. The relationship between observed signs of distress/discomfort and the
verbalisation of such experiences

The examinations of the video-recorded visits to the CHC, revealed
that signs of distress/discomfort (scores equal to or above 3 on the 5-
point scale) could be observed in 36% (n = 10) of the children. Of the
4-year-olds 31% displayed discomfort and the average level of dis-
comfort was 2.0 (SD = 1.0). Of the 5-year-olds 42% displayed distress
and the average level of distress was 2.3 (SD= 1.2). A Mann-Whitney U
test showed no significant difference between the two age groups in
level of observed discomfort/distress.

When comparing the observed signs of distress or discomfort with
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the verbalisation of these experiences, the following pattern emerges
(Table 1). All 5-year-olds who displayed distress also provided eva-
luative statements relating to these experiences in the interviews,
whereas none of the 4-year-olds who showed signs of discomfort ver-
balised any negative emotional experiences relating to the health visit.
In total 18 children showed no clear signs of distress or discomfort at
the health visit, however six of these children still reported having
experienced procedures at the visit as negative (i.e. as distressing or
discomforting).

4. Discussion

There is a need to increase knowledge on supportive and reliable
interviewing techniques that can be used in various fields, beyond the
forensic context, and that can aid children to express their emotional
and physical reactions to experiences. This study was the first to qua-
litatively explore to what extent the In My Shoes interview aided pre-
school aged children in verbalising experiences of distress or discomfort
related to a health visit. Furthermore, the relationship between ob-
served signs of distress/discomfort at the visit and the verbalisation of
such experiences in the interviews was also of interest.

4.1. The extent of children’s verbalisation of experiences of distress/
discomfort

The results demonstrated that 39% of the children expressed having
experienced the specific procedure (i.e. vaccination or vision test) at the
health visit as highly or moderately distressing or causing discomfort.
All of these children, except one, were 5 years old. This pattern was
expected. The specific procedure varied between the age groups and
getting a vaccination can be presumed to be more stressful than an
optometric examination. The optometric examination is not painful, but
it requires the child to understand the task, perform well (to see the
letters), and to sit still and focus. This could evoke discomfort and re-
actions of shame (not succeeding to perform), confusion (not under-
standing what to perform) or frustration (Stipek, Recchia, McClintic, &
Lewis, 1992). The higher degree of distress among the 5-year olds was
not unexpected considering the potential pain it causes (Taddio et al.,
2009) and that many children are afraid of getting a vaccination (Hart
& Bossert, 1994; Taddio et al., 2012).

4.2. In My Shoes as a prompt for emotional experiences

A closer examination of In My Shoes as a context for children’s
verbalisation revealed several interesting findings. First, the systematic
examination of interview sequences showed that almost all children
provided their responses in relation to the In My Shoes interview
structure where different emotion prompts are followed by open-ended
and/or evaluative questions. By providing the child with icons and
questions about specific emotions, it seems like the child gets help with
assessing if she or he has felt in a specific way. The meaning of this
emotion is then explored primarily through open-ended and evaluative

follow-up questions. The results are in line with previous research de-
monstrating that when interviewers emphasise the importance of eva-
luative information by adding specific cues or evaluative questions,
children respond by including such information in their statements
(Lyon et al., 2012; Peterson et al., 2013; Stolzenberg et al., 2019). The
In My Shoes interview structure develops this further, as it is even more
specific when asking children about various kinds of emotions as well as
providing children with pictorial support. Thus, the In My Shoes emo-
tion prompts seem to function both as a point of entry to aid children’s
memory retrieval and as a means for them to include evaluative aspects
of their experiences. These results are in line with previous research
investigating Tulving’s principle of encoding specificity where context
reinstatement, including emotion reinstatement, can aid children’s
memory retrieval (for example Memon, Meissner, & Fraser, 2010).

The second important finding is that even though children were
posed “Yes/No” questions in relation to emotions, i.e. “Did you ever feel
this way when you were at the CHC?”, children often answered “No”
and seemed to wait until an emotional prompt was provided that re-
sonated with them. This is demonstrated with Extract 2 where the child
has replied “No” to all emotional questions preceding the extract, be-
fore answering “Yes” to the questions about feeling scared. When
children answered “Yes” to an emotional prompt, they could often
elaborate on and nuance their answers, e.g. they provided nuanced
descriptions of their emotions (“I was a bit sad”).

4.3. Types of evaluative information included in the children’s statements

The third important finding is that children distinguish between
emotions and physical sensations and In My Shoes seems to aid some
children in including both these aspects of experiences in their narra-
tives. Children’s verbalisations of negative emotions were varied as they
could narrate feeling sad, scared or even angry. In addition to these
emotions, several children also talked about physical sensations, such
as pain or hurt, related to the specific procedures at the health visit. In
most contexts, social work, health care or investigative, both the
emotional and physical aspects of children’s experiences are of great
importance. Research on standard verbal child investigative interviews
have shown that children seldom mention their emotions or physical
reactions spontaneously (Westcott & Kynan, 2004) and in order to in-
clude them they need specific questions on emotional reactions, specific
questions on physical reactions and specific questions on cognitive as-
pects (Stolzenberg et al., 2019). Thus, it is promising that In My Shoes
seems to help some children include both their emotional and physical
reactions when narrating their experiences of distress or discomfort.

4.4. In My Shoes as prompt for other emotional experiences

In addition to the findings discussed above, we noted that in a few
instances the In My Shoes prompts did not work as intended. Some
children verbalised their physical sensations (but not emotions) of
distress or discomfort only in relation to evaluative questions. Other
children did not verbalise any negative emotional experiences, while
others did so, but not in relation to the specific health visit in focus for
the interview. The majority of these children were 4 years old. They
seldom answered “Yes” to any emotional prompt, except feeling
“Happy” and they did not spontaneously include negative emotional or
physical aspects in their narratives when asked other questions, such as
open-ended questions. Several of the 4-year-olds did however provide
narratives on other health care experiences or on their sibling’s reaction
to a health care procedure, in relation to the In My Shoes negative
emotional prompts. However, these narratives could not be confirmed
by the video-recordings of the visit to the CHC. Nevertheless, the results
could be understood as though the In My Shoes emotional prompts did
help the 4-year-olds to retrieve memories that were evoked by the
emotion in question. In line with this reasoning, it might have been that
the emotional prompts included in the In My Shoes interview did not

Table 1
Number of children with observed distress/discomfort in relation to age and
verbalized distress/discomfort in the interview.

Interview

Verbalised Not verbalised

Observed distress/discomfort
4-year-olds (n = 5) 0 5
5-year-olds (n = 5) 5 0
No observed distress/discomfort
4-year-olds (n = 11) 1 10
5-year-olds (n = 7) 5 2
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resonate with the emotions these children had experienced at the health
visit, and thus did not elicit any emotional narratives related to the
visit.

4.5. The relationship between observed signs of distress/discomfort and the
verbalisation of such experiences

As discussed above, the results showed that less than one third of
the 4-year-olds displayed clear signs of discomfort related to the opto-
metric examination, and of the 5-year-olds, 42% showed signs of dis-
tress related to the vaccination. When comparing the observed signs of
distress or discomfort with children’s verbalisations of such experi-
ences, some interesting findings emerged. The key finding was that In
My Shoes helped all 5-year-olds who displayed distress at the health
visit to verbalise their experiences in the interviews. Their narratives
contained detailed and nuanced descriptions of the negative emotions
and/or physical sensations they had experienced. This is an important
finding as it is well known that the level of distress during an event can
affect the memory of that event (Fivush, McDermott Sales, Goldberg,
Bahrick, & Parker, 2004) and some studies show that children provide
less information of lower quality about stressful events (Merritt,
Ornstein, & Spicker, 1994). The majority of the 4-year-olds did not
show signs of discomfort, neither did they report any such experiences.
However, the group of children aged 4 years who did display dis-
comfort did not verbalise their emotional experiences at the visit either.
The explanation for this could be that none of the In My Shoes emo-
tional prompts resonated with the experience at the visit. Whether In
My Shoes works as intended for 4-year-olds needs to be further ex-
amined.

For some of the children there were inconsistencies in the re-
lationship between the displayed and verbalised distress/discomfort.
These children, all aged 5 years, showed no clear signs of distress at the
visit, but they reported such experiences in the interviews. These chil-
dren could have had a better ability to regulate their emotions during
the health visit, as well as help with coping from parents and/or nurse,
which might have affected the extent to which they displayed clear
signs of distress. However, studies are needed to further investigate the
relationship between different levels of observed distress and verbalised
experiences of distress and discomfort using In My Shoes, and whether
different patterns in content emerge. Based on our results the conclu-
sion is that it is not sufficient to let children’s explicit signs of distress or
discomfort guide beliefs about their experiences. Rather, this finding
further stresses the importance of posing questions on emotional and
physical reactions to all children in order to grasp children’s experi-
ences.

4.6. Leading aspects of the In My Shoes prompts and questions

Although this study primarily aims to contribute to knowledge on
supportive and reliable interviewing techniques that can be used out-
side of the forensic context, some comments about the leading com-
ponents of the In My Shoes interview are warranted. The In My Shoes
interview was developed to have forensic value and adhere to best
practice interviewing regarding, for example, the recommended ques-
tion types used. Our results demonstrate that when interviewers follow
these recommendations by combining the In My Shoes emotion
prompts (icon and question) with open-ended or evaluative follow-up
questions, children’s verbalisation of the emotional and physical aspects
of their experiences are benefited. However, the In My Shoes interview
also contains questions that, from a forensic perspective, may be seen as
problematic. When children are asked about specific emotions in rela-
tion to the context in focus for the interview, i.e. “Did you ever feel this
way when you were at the CHC?”, the interviewer suggests the emotion
and poses a yes/no-question. Such procedure is known to enhance the
risk of leading the child and increase the number of false statements
(Lamb et al., 2007). The current study did not set out to investigate the

occurrence of true or false statements. However, a previous study of In
My Shoes demonstrates that the method yielded statements with high
accuracy (Fängström et al., 2016). What the results from this study did
show, is that children said “No” to emotional prompts when they did
not seem to resonate with the child’s experienced emotions during the
health visit. The findings thus indicate that the pre-school children in
this context managed and resisted the leading component of the In My
Shoes questions.

5. Limitations

There are some important limitations with our study, one of which
is the small sample size which affects the generalisability of the results.
Studies with larger samples and a quantitative approach are needed in
order to further examine In My Shoes as a prompt for children’s emo-
tional experiences and the relationship between children’s observable
signs of distress and their verbalisations of such experiences. In addi-
tion, there is a need to investigate whether In My Shoes adds value by
comparing the ability of In My Shoes with a standard verbal interview
procedure to elicit children’s statements on their emotions and physical
sensations. Previous research indicates that there are gendered patterns
in the way younger children express emotional experiences, however, a
larger sample is necessary to explore to what extent such patterns can
be seen in In My Shoes interviews. Similarly, it has not been possible to
explore to what extent the time frame between the event and the in-
terview plays a part in the way the In My Shoes interview works in
relation to evaluative contents. The second important limitation is the
homogenous sample. The majority of children in our study had parents
who were born in Sweden and who were highly educated. Thus, the
sample is not representative to the population from whence it was
drawn. A third limitation is the lack of information on children’s lan-
guage, level of speech, IQ and disabilities. It is well known that children
with conditions impacting their communicative abilities are over-re-
presented in social services and child protection contexts.

6. Conclusions

This study was the first step in exploring to what extent the In My
Shoes interview aid preschool aged children in verbalising experiences
of distress or discomfort. The results suggest that In My Shoes may be a
feasible tool to support childreńs verbalisation of distress and that it
helps some children to make a distinction between emotions and phy-
sical sensations and include both these aspects in their narratives.
Furthermore, we observed that In My Shoes works as a prompt for
emotional experiences, both for experiences at the health visit, and also
in other contexts, especially with respect to the 4-year-olds. Finally, all
5-year-olds in this sample who were clearly distressed at the health visit
did later verbalise their experiences in the In My Shoes interview, while
the majority of 4-year-olds in the sample who showed signs of dis-
comfort did not verbalise any emotional experiences related to the
health visit. More research is needed to establish in which contexts and
for which children In My Shoes can aid children in expressing their
emotional and physical reactions to experiences.
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